
1-1 1-2 1-3 1-4 1-5 1-6 1-7 1-8 1-9 1-10 1-11 1-12
S.WHITE S. YELLOW BR.YELLOW MARKINGS LEGENDS S. WHITE S. YELLOW B. YELLOW MARKINGS LEGENDS S. WHITE S. YELLOW

MILE MILE MILE SQ. FT. SQ. FT. MILE MILE MILE SQ. FT. SQ. FT. MILE MILE
Highway Management Systems 

Calera, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

J.C. Cheek Contractors Laceys 
Springs, AL $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $1,850.00 $6.50 $6.50 $2,950.00 $2,950.00 $1,450.00 $6.50 $6.50 $625.00 $625.00

Ozark Striping Company LLC 
Ozark, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 

        

CLASS 2,  TYPE A

BID OPENING DATE:   2:00 PM  SEPTEMBER 2, 2025

CLASS 2T, TYPE A

MARSHALL COUNTY COMMISSION

BID TABULATION FOR BID #13-25
TRAFFIC STRIPING

GUNTERSVILLE  AL  35976
424 BLOUNT AVENUE

CLASS 1, TYPE A



          Awarded 9/10/2025

1-13 1-14 1-15 1-16 1-17
B. WHITE B. YELLOW S. TEMP. B. TEMP. MARKERS

MILE MILE MILE MILE EACH

Highway Management Systems 
Calera, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

J.C. Cheek Contractors Laceys 
Springs, AL $295.00 $295.00 $950.00 $950.00 $6.50

Ozark Striping Company LLC 
Ozark, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 

          Awarded 9/10/2025

BID TABULATION FOR BID #13-25
TRAFFIC STRIPING

BID OPENING DATE:   2:00 PM  SEPTEMBER 2, 2025

CLASS 1  TYPE A CLASS  A-H 1-B,2-D OR 2-E
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